
HaMotzi Dinners 
Feeding the food insecure 
within our local community 
with monthly dinners 

Volunteers needed for set-up, 
serving and food donations 

Contact: Paulette Sterman-
Soroko: 

pstermanbeach@gmail.com

HaMotzi Food Pantry 
Providing non-perishables 
such as: fruit, veggies, pasta 

Food donations needed/
items available for purchase 
each Sunday at JQuest. 

Contact: Jack Myers 
myersinphilly@comcast.net 

Mitzvoteinu 
Mentoring our 6th graders on 
how to do mitzvot inside and 
outside of our community 

Mentors needed to work with 
our 6th graders 

Contact:  Jaimie Shmelzer 
jaimie@kenesethisrael.org

Hannukah Luncheon 
Partnering with Federation 
for Seniors, offering a 
Hanukkah Luncheon 

Volunteers needed to help 
with luncheon  

Contact:  Debbie Zlotnick 
dzlotnick@comcast.net

Tzedek Center 
Collecting non-perishables 
for the Abington Food Pantry, 
Lowell Elementary, and St. 
Chris Children’s Hospital 

Volunteers needed to sort 
and transport donations. 

Contact:  Judi Metz 
metzman961@verizon.net

Tutoring 
Supporting the 
Cheltenham school district 
community, financially, 
socially and academically. 

Tutors and school supplies 

donations needed. 

Contact:  Toby Grubman 
tobgru@aol.com 

Blood Drive 
Giving blood monthly and to 
help those in need of this life 
giving force  

Volunteers needed to 
schedule potential donors 

Contact:  Mike Levin 
michael@mlevinco.com 

Caring Community 
Offering meals and rides to 
those KI congregants in 
immediate need 

Volunteers needed to make 
meals and to deliver them 

Contact: Elaine Glass 
elaineglass@comcast.net 
Susan Zaslow: 
sbzaslow@gmail.com

Inclusion Committee 
Embracing all congregants 
and reaching out to those 
who have special needs 

Volunteers needed for our 
committee & JDAIM Shabbat 

Contact: Ellen Sklaroff 
ellensklaroff@gmail.com

Mitzvah Food Garden 
Growing food for our food 
insecure and offering fresh 
options at Hamotzi Dinners 

Volunteers needed in the 
spring for planting 

Contact:  Lynore Eisman 
lynore@comcast.net

Gift of Life 
Bringing awareness to the 
importance of organ, tissue, 
and bone marrow donation 

Volunteers to help with Gift of 
Life events 

Contact:  Lynore Eisman 
lynore@comcast.net

Hesed Center  
Ongoing programming to 
help support congregants in 
emotional need 

Currently offering a 
Bereavement Group 

Contact:  Bonnie Klein 

Bkki279@comcast.net
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Families Forward 
Helping in the only 
homeless shelter in Philly 
that keeps families 
together 

Volunteers needed for our 
Wellness Day and penpals 

Contact: Jonathan 
Schmalzbach 
jonathanschmalzbach@yahoo.com

Cook for a Friend 
Cooking meals for 
Kleinlife’s Home Meal 
Delivery program 

Volunteers needed once a 
month to prepare meals 
during the day 

Contact: Diane Miller 
dianedm319@hotmail.com

Mitzvah Menorah 
Collecting gifts, school 
supplies, and uniforms for 
the students at Lowell 
Elementary for Christmas 

Gifts and present wrappers 
are needed 

Contact: Jaimie Shmelzer 
jaimie@kenesethisrael.org

Social Justice 
Social and Political 
Advocacy, Action, and 
Education throughout the 
year 

Members interested in 
Social Justice needed for 
the committee 

Contact:  Arlene Holtz 
arlenebholtz@gmail.com

HH Days Food Drive 
Our annual non-perishable 
food drive between Rosh 
Hashanah and Yom Kippur 

Volunteers needed to 
staple flyers on bags and 
then sort food 

Contact: Judy Greenberg 
judyg522@comcast.net

Greenfaith 
Promoting  sustainability 
and offering environmental 
education in our 
community 

Volunteers needed for  
programming and ideas 

Contact: Wendy Ankrom 
wacomisar@gmail.com

Elderly 
Transportation 
Providing transportation 
for our seniors to KI 
Shabbat services/events 

Volunteers needed to drive 
congregants to services 

Contact:  Anita Madnick 
anita@kenesethisrael.org

College Mentors 
Mentoring program to help 
first-generation, low-
income college students 

Mentors and connections to 
colleges needed 

Contact: Gordon Meyers 
gmeyers@aya.yale.edu

Please support our 
KI Funds for Social 
Action Programs:

• Sharing is Caring Fund 
• Richman Fund for Elder Care 
• Cantor’s & Rabbi’s Philanthropic Funds
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